MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE AL 35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #31A4-24

HOT BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT (COMPLETE IN-PLACE)

BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM AUGUST 27, 2024

DISTRICT 1
VENDOR BID PRICES PER TON
1. 2. 3. 4. 5. 6. 7. 8. 9. 10. 11.
301-4 408-A 408-4 424-A 424-A 424-A 424-B 424-B 424-C 424-C 430-B
CRUSHED PLANING PLANING WEARING WEARING WEARING BINDER BINDER WIDENING | PATCHING SHOULDER
AGGREGATE 0-2" 2-4" 3/8" 12" 3/4" 3/4" 1" 1" 112" BUILD-UP
Midsouth Paving Inc.
Birmingham, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rogers Group Inc.
Huntsville, AL $32.75 $0.95 $1.05 $85.00 $83.50 $78.00 $73.00 $69.00 $75.00 $93.00 $32.00
Vulcan Materials Company
Birminham, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wiregrass Construction
Huntsville, AL $48.55 $3.15 $4.27 $104.36 $102.01 $100.13 $100.94 $92.48 $97.04 $142.61 $53.81
Wright Construction Co.
Huntsville, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grayson Carter and Son
Contracting Inc.
Athens, AL $33.50 $1.00 $1.00 $90.00 $84.00 $82.50 $76.00 $72.50 $80.00 $120.00 $33.50
Awarded 9/11/2024
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